State of South Dakota

SEVENTY-SEVENTH SESSION
LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY, 2002

10

11

12

13

14

15

640H0646
SENATE ENGROSSED No. HB 1237 - 021202002

Introduced by: Representatives Richter, Burg, Derby, and Olson (Méel) and Senators Drake,
Dennert, Duxbury, and Putnam

FOR AN ACT ENTITLED, An Act to amend the General Appropriations Act for fiscal year
2002.
BE IT ENACTED BY THE LEGISLATURE OF THE STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA:
Section 1. That section 16 of chapter 3 of the 2001 Session Laws be amended to read as
follows:
DEPARTMENT OF CORRECTIONS
State Penitentiary
Operating Expenses, delete "$4,922,325" and insert "$5,415,825".
Adjus all totals accordingly.
Section 2. That section 17 of chapter 3 of the 2001 Session Laws be amended to read as
follows:
DEPARTMENT OF HUMAN SERVICES
Developmental Disabilities
Operating Expenses, delete "$21,481,272" and insert "$21,974,772" and delete

$40,011,775" and insert "40,598,775".

350 copies of this document were printed by the South Dakota Insertionsinto existing statutes are indicated by underscores.
Legidative Research Council at a cost of $.027 per page. V Deletions from existing statutes are indicated by eversirikes.



10

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

-2- HB 1237

Adjus all totals accordingly.
Section 3. That section 14 of chapter 3 of the 2001 Session Laws be amended to read as
follows:
BOARD OF REGENTS
South Dakota School of Medicine
Personal Services, delete "$9,175,134" and insert "$9,675,134"
Section 4. Any expenditure authority or cash appropriated by this Act which are unspent at
the end of fiscal year 2002 shall be carried over to fiscal year 2003.
Section 5. That chapter 3 of the 2001 Session Laws be amended to read as follows:
After Section 27, insert:
"Section 27A. The state treasurer shall transfer to the general fund from the youth-at-risk
fund the sum of three hundred ninety-six thousand dollars ($396,000).
Section 27B. Thestatetreasurer shall transfer to the general fund from the peopl e'strust fund
the sum of one hundred ninety-one thousand dollars ($191,000).
Section 27C. The state treasurer shall transfer to the general fund from the South Dakota
Building Authority the sum of nine hundred thousand dollars ($900,000)."

Section 6. This Act is effective June 11, 2002.



